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In order to bridge the lack of information on child labour and to stimulate policy interventions the IREWOC
Foundation (International Research on Working Children) has undertaken action-based research in the field
of the worst forms of child labour in Latin America. In 2006 and 2007 a comparative study on the Worst
Forms of Child Labour was carried out in 7 different economic sectors in Bolivia, Guatemala and Peru
focussing on the hazardous worst forms. The central research objectives were as follows: • to map the
working and living situations of children who are working in specific economic sectors and what the
consequences of this work are for their physical and emotional wellbeing. • to investigate the reasons why
these children are working in these worst forms sectors. The research results were expected to give important
insights into the currently polarised debate between those who state child labour is above all related to
cultural considerations and those who state that economic reasons are fundamental to the phenomena of child
labour. • to map the existing policy initiatives for child labourers in the worst forms and to identify the best
practices. In the face of challenges imposed by achieving the Millennium Development Goals (MDGs) set by
the UN, specific attention was paid to educational initiatives. Is education a useful tool in combating child
labour, and vice versa, is child labour a significant obstacle to achieving universal primary education?
Although the evidence from the various cases discussed in the book illustrate positive trends in terms of the
worst forms of child labor, thousands of children were still found to be engaged in activities that form a
direct threat to their physical, mental and moral health and jeopardize their education. This book proposes
several practical recommendations for possible interventions.
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From reader reviews:

Shameka Nye:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, likely to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your
free time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the guide untitled Hazardous Child Labour in Latin America can be excellent
book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

William Lyons:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Hazardous Child Labour in Latin
America reserve written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which might be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Hazardous
Child Labour in Latin America as good book not merely by the cover but also with the content. This is one
book that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening
to a different sixth sense.

Joe North:

The book untitled Hazardous Child Labour in Latin America contain a lot of information on it. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy approach. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was authored by famous author. The author
brings you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can please read on
your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Patsy Phan:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It
is known as of book Hazardous Child Labour in Latin America. You can add your knowledge by it. Without
leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical
that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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